
 

 

 
 

                                                                    
 
 

 
 

 Freedom of Information Request – 2401 
 

I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the 
following information: 
 

1. The total number of patients that have been treated at your hospital for 
botched non-surgical procedures (cosmetic treatments) for 2019-2024. 
Information not held.  

 
2. The total cost of treating botched non-surgical procedures at your hospital for 

the consecutive years 2019-2024, in terms of annual costs. 
Information not held. 
 

3. The total number of patients that your hospital have referred to private clinics 
to treat botched non-surgical procedures for the consecutive years 2019-2024. 
Information not held. 
 

4. How many botched surgeries were undertaken by non-medical or 
unprofessional practitioners?  
Information not held. 

 
5. The total number of patients that have been treated at your hospital for 

botched surgical procedures for 2019-2024. 
Information not held. 

 
6. The total cost of treating botched surgical procedures at your hospital for the 

consecutive years 2019-2024, in terms of annual costs. 
Information not held. 

 
7. The total number of patients that your hospital have referred to private clinics 

to treat botched surgical procedures for the consecutive years 2019-2024. 
Information not held. 

 


